
[[SPM647231]] SENNEBOGAN 835M 835.0.2195 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP435699
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SPM647231

SIMS METAL MANAGEMENT2500 S. PAULINACHICAGO, ILUS  60608Contact: RYAN WISEryan.wise@simsmm.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. No other corrective action isrecommended at this time.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Light fuel dilution occurring. Noother contaminants were detected inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: SIMCHIILUnique No: 10882799Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 19 Feb 2024
Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 06089946 (Generated: 02/19/2024 22:19:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435699 VCP401722 VCP404343 VCP343321Sample Date 03 Feb 2024 02 Aug 2023 03 Apr 2023 24 Aug 2022Machine Hours 18465 18054 17516 16508Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 14.8 12.3 13.0Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.6 8.8 6.2 8.0Oxidation (PA) % 66 54 86 66
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.1 0.5 0.2Nitration (PA) % 81 47 103 88Sulfation (PA) % 55 49 65 58Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 1.0 <1.0 1.9 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 5 7 10Sodium ppm 1 2 0 1Potassium ppm 2 2 2 4
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 6 44 18Copper ppm 20 13 213 384Lead ppm <1 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 2 4Chromium ppm <1 <1 2 <1Molybdenum ppm 45 55 40 33Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 1Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 3Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1133 1054 1256 1766Magnesium ppm 1002 955 798 331Zinc ppm 1232 1272 1084 1026Phosphorus ppm 978 1024 861 821Barium ppm 0 0 0 7Boron ppm 14 4 14 33

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 06089946 (Generated: 02/19/2024 22:19:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGAN SENNEBOGAN 835M 835.0.2195\Diesel Engine [VCP435699] 03 Feb 2024 @ 18465.0 hrs

