
[[SPM646500 AMG]] SENNEBOGEN 835M 835.0.2002 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP435724
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM646500 AMG

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: MARK DEROSAmark.derosa@altg.comT: (248)356-5200F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.High concentration ofvisible yellow metal present. Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated. Noother contaminants were detected inthe oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10883379Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06090526 (Generated: 02/17/2024 13:17:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK DEROSA - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435724 VCP422577 VCP406716 VCP328721Sample Date 04 Jan 2024 07 Jul 2023 14 Apr 2023 30 Aug 2021Machine Hours 15647 8436 13746 8073Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL SEVERE ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 138 140 146 144
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 8 5 9 2Sodium ppm 0 0 1 2Potassium ppm <1 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 28 17 54 32Copper ppm 261 103 370 100Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 1 <1 <1 2Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 0 <1 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 0 1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 73 57 324 15Magnesium ppm 2 0 4 <1Zinc ppm 156 76 314 53Phosphorus ppm 913 1097 869 923Barium ppm 0 0 <1 0Boron ppm 241 309 139 168

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06090526 (Generated: 02/17/2024 13:17:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK DEROSA - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835M 835.0.2002\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP435724] 04 Jan 2024 @ 15647.0 hrs

