
[[5809HO]] VOLVO ECR355EL 310191 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP452209
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 5809HO

PENNSYLVANIA SUPPLY833 PAXTON STREETHARRISBURG, PAUS  17104Contact: KEVIN TAYLORKTAYLOR@OLDCASTLEMATERIALS.COMT: (717)236-7040F: (717)238-5831
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Theamount and size of particulatespresent in the system are acceptable.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: PENHARUnique No: 10885127Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Feb 2024
Report Id: PENHAR [WUSCAR] 06092274 (Generated: 02/20/2024 22:59:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN TAYLOR - PENHAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP452209 VCP414533 VCP366150 VCP336349Sample Date 09 Feb 2024 20 Sep 2023 16 Sep 2022 14 Sep 2021Machine Hours 3809 3368 2172 1035Oil Hours 500 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed N/A Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.5 42.3 42.3 43.4Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 1.07 1.10 1.16 0.925
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 15195 2641 196273 ---Particles >6µm 849 271 21058 ---Particles >14µm 28 43 521 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/17/12 19/15/13 25/22/16 ---Silicon ppm 7 6 6 5Sodium ppm 2 2 2 3Potassium ppm <1 0 0 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 4 10 8Copper ppm 17 17 20 12Lead ppm 2 1 4 <1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 <1 1 2Chromium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 5 4 2 1Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 0 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2170 2195 2409 1699Magnesium ppm 70 62 30 19Zinc ppm 1047 1071 1062 885Phosphorus ppm 800 878 899 732Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 59 60 58 41

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PENHAR [WUSCAR] 06092274 (Generated: 02/20/2024 22:59:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN TAYLOR - PENHAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR355EL 310191\Hydraulic System [VCP452209] 09 Feb 2024 @ 3809.0 hrs

