
[[5809HO]] VOLVO ECR355EL 310191 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP452210
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No: 5809HO

PENNSYLVANIA SUPPLY833 PAXTON STREETHARRISBURG, PAUS  17104Contact: KEVIN TAYLORKTAYLOR@OLDCASTLEMATERIALS.COMT: (717)236-7040F: (717)238-5831
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor.All componentwear rates are normal. Free waterpresent. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: PENHARUnique No: 10885427Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 20 Feb 2024
Report Id: PENHAR [WUSCAR] 06092574 (Generated: 02/20/2024 22:59:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN TAYLOR - PENHAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP452210 VCP320863 VCP255010 ---Sample Date 09 Feb 2024 14 Sep 2021 16 Jul 2020 ---Machine Hours 3809 1035 496 ---Oil Hours 2000 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed N/A ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 152 251 183 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.120 NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 5 2 9 ---Sodium ppm 0 0 0 ---Potassium ppm 2 0 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 370 130 492 ---Copper ppm 9 5 18 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 2 <1 0 ---Chromium ppm 4 2 7 ---Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 0 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Manganese ppm 3 2 5 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 42 55 6 ---Magnesium ppm 28 15 4 ---Zinc ppm 29 34 17 ---Phosphorus ppm 904 748 414 ---Barium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Boron ppm 27 184 2 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PENHAR [WUSCAR] 06092574 (Generated: 02/20/2024 22:59:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEVIN TAYLOR - PENHAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR355EL 310191\Swing Drive [VCP452210] 09 Feb 2024 @ 3809.0 hrs

