
[[X13899 IAA]] VOLVO L90G 617336 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP399015
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: X13899 IAA

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Broussard100 IDA ROADBROUSSARD, LAUS  70518Contact: ADAM FEIRMANafeirman@scottcompanies.comT: (337)837-2907F: (337)837-5116
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thealuminum level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6241Unique No: 10885585Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 20 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO6241 [WUSCAR] 06092732 (Generated: 02/20/2024 15:42:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ADAM FEIRMAN - VOLVO6241

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP399015 VCP324683 VCP254065 VCP194779Sample Date 14 Feb 2024 29 Jul 2021 16 Oct 2020 24 Oct 2018Machine Hours 8503 8007 6996 6220Oil Hours 500 1000 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.6 13.3 13.1 13.2Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.8 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 77 65 88 80
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.3 0.2 0.7Nitration (PA) % 67 85 67 60Sulfation (PA) % 58 61 61 63Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 3 7 8Sodium ppm 1 2 2 4Potassium ppm 2 2 0 4
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 19 28 50Copper ppm 2 3 2 1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 27 6 18 11Chromium ppm <1 <1 2 <1Molybdenum ppm 33 6 44 40Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1444 1405 1730 1831Magnesium ppm 488 681 503 526Zinc ppm 1021 782 901 938Phosphorus ppm 904 659 763 729Barium ppm 10 0 0 0Boron ppm 34 31 47 48

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6241 [WUSCAR] 06092732 (Generated: 02/20/2024 15:42:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ADAM FEIRMAN - VOLVO6241
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90G 617336\Diesel Engine [VCP399015] 14 Feb 2024 @ 8503.0 hrs

