
VOLVO A30G 752372 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP412723
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

SANTA ROSA COUNTY LANDFILLS6337 DA LISA RDMILTON, FLUS  32583Contact: ROLAND MCKINNONrolandm@santarosa.fl.govT: (850)777-0573F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of wear.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The copperlevel is severe. All other componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SANMILFLUnique No: 10886186Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 21 Feb 2024
Report Id: SANMILFL [WUSCAR] 06093333 (Generated: 02/21/2024 17:51:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROLAND MCKINNON - SANMILFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412723 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2500 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 18 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 32 --- --- ---Copper ppm 230 --- --- ---Lead ppm 6 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3387 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1373 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1172 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 109 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SANMILFL [WUSCAR] 06093333 (Generated: 02/21/2024 17:51:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROLAND MCKINNON - SANMILFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 752372\Drop Box [VCP412723] 09 Feb 2024 @ 2500.0 hrs

