
[[SWO-069745 APAC]] VOLVO L150H 6816 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP444449
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 101
Job No: SWO-069745 APAC

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY2238 PINSON VALLEY PARKWAYBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35217Contact: BRANTLY CLAYbclay@cowin.comT: F: (205)856-2106
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8528Unique No: 10887356Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 21 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8528 [WUSCAR] 06094503 (Generated: 02/21/2024 06:04:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANTLY CLAY - VOLVO8528

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444449 VCP289489 VCP271672 ---Sample Date 15 Feb 2024 06 Oct 2020 28 May 2020 ---Machine Hours 7536 2531 2006 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed N/A Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 50.1 49.1 40.0 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 11 10 12 ---Sodium ppm 0 6 4 ---Potassium ppm 0 1 2 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 88 36 120 ---Copper ppm 30 11 19 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm <1 <1 0 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 4 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 7 2 ---Nickel ppm <1 1 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 ---Silver ppm 0 1 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 1 5 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3048 3384 3561 ---Magnesium ppm 9 83 8 ---Zinc ppm 1349 1368 1348 ---Phosphorus ppm 1098 1165 1202 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 96 103 107 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8528 [WUSCAR] 06094503 (Generated: 02/21/2024 06:04:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANTLY CLAY - VOLVO8528
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6816\Front Axle [VCP444449] 15 Feb 2024 @ 7536.0 hrs

