
VOLVO EW180E K00320339 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP381522
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No:

DUNN COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENTROUTE 2 BOX 71A, 3303 US HWY 12 EASTMENOMONIE, WIUS  54751Contact: DANNY NELSONdnelson@co.dunn.wi.usT: (715)232-2361F: (715)232-3888
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: DUNMENUnique No: 10887539Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 21 Feb 2024
Report Id: DUNMEN [WUSCAR] 06094686 (Generated: 02/21/2024 16:54:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANNY NELSON - DUNMEN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP381522 VC527562 VC549442 VC524307Sample Date 08 Feb 2024 10 Feb 2022 21 Jan 2021 22 Jul 2019Machine Hours 2660 2095 1635 1047Oil Hours 205 267 203 196Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.2 13.6 13.3 14.03Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.4 9.0 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 57 61 71 67
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 56 66 58 60Sulfation (PA) % 51 55 58 50Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 10 6 9Sodium ppm 2 2 0 5Potassium ppm 4 7 6 10
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 18 14 6 7Copper ppm <1 1 2 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 5 10 0 4Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 29 20 27 51Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1910 1986 1556 1601Magnesium ppm 397 263 546 856Zinc ppm 1175 995 851 1083Phosphorus ppm 945 814 765 980Barium ppm 14 0 0 0Boron ppm 24 33 65 47

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DUNMEN [WUSCAR] 06094686 (Generated: 02/21/2024 16:54:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANNY NELSON - DUNMEN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EW180E K00320339\Diesel Engine [VCP381522] 08 Feb 2024 @ 2660.0 hrs

