
[[8769]] VOLVO A40G 341642 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP454098
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 8769

ORANGE COUNTY SOLID WASTE5901 YOUNG PINE ROADORLANDO, FLUS  32829Contact: MICHAEL BEEBEmichael.beebe@ocfl.netT: (407)836-6652F: (407)836-6650
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: ORAORLUnique No: 10888734Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 22 Feb 2024
Report Id: ORAORL [WUSCAR] 06095881 (Generated: 02/22/2024 10:33:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL BEEBE - ORAORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454098 VCP405202 VCP370511 VCP326119Sample Date 14 Feb 2024 12 Apr 2023 29 Dec 2022 12 Feb 2022Machine Hours 11980 10853 10399 8928Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 337 329 327 317
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 5 5 5 4Sodium ppm 0 1 0 0Potassium ppm 1 2 1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 113 85 65 45Copper ppm 6 4 4 3Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 0 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 1 2 1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 2 1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 147 140 141 109Magnesium ppm 15 20 14 13Zinc ppm 97 93 87 59Phosphorus ppm 984 1009 992 945Barium ppm <1 0 1 0Boron ppm 168 157 117 103

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ORAORL [WUSCAR] 06095881 (Generated: 02/22/2024 10:33:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL BEEBE - ORAORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 341642\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP454098] 14 Feb 2024 @ 11980.0 hrs

