
[[S50601798 IAA BAY PT]] VOLVO L90H 624600 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP340922
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: S50601798 IAA BAY PT

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT1944 MARINA BLVDSAN LEANDRO, CAUS  94577Contact: DAVE HILDEBRANDdavid.hildebrand@vcesvolvo.comT: (510)357-9131F: (925)294-9240
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO4487Unique No: 10896274Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 23 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO4487 [WUSCAR] 06098044 (Generated: 02/23/2024 14:38:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE HILDEBRAND - VOLVO4487

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP340922 VCP341734 VCP295807 ---Sample Date 16 Feb 2024 09 Jan 2023 06 Oct 2021 ---Machine Hours 9504 7523 5204 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.4 26.6 26.0 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 3 5 8 ---Sodium ppm 0 3 4 ---Potassium ppm 2 0 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 16 24 41 ---Copper ppm 2 4 5 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 1 1 <1 ---Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 2 4 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 79 77 105 ---Magnesium ppm 2 0 <1 ---Zinc ppm 18 0 28 ---Phosphorus ppm 139 173 167 ---Barium ppm 0 0 1 ---Boron ppm 86 69 65 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4487 [WUSCAR] 06098044 (Generated: 02/23/2024 14:38:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE HILDEBRAND - VOLVO4487
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624600\Transmission (Auto) [VCP340922] 16 Feb 2024 @ 9504.0 hrs

