
VOLVO A30G 742411 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP439110
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: BRAD BYRObradley.byro@altg.comT: (407)850-9614F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. Moderateconcentration of visible dirt/debrispresent in the oil. The condition ofthe oil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10896970Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06098740 (Generated: 02/26/2024 15:14:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRAD BYRO - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439110 VCP275816 --- ---Sample Date 22 Feb 2024 26 May 2020 --- ---Machine Hours 5942 2049 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.6 45.5 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 11 9 --- ---Sodium ppm 5 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 23 8 --- ---Copper ppm 198 80 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1504 1781 --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 4 --- ---Zinc ppm 671 823 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 597 712 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 41 49 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06098740 (Generated: 02/26/2024 15:14:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRAD BYRO - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 742411\Wet Disc Brake [VCP439110] 22 Feb 2024 @ 5942.0 hrs

