
[[SW-29950 SEG 1 RANGO]] VOLVO R100E 121011 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP372323
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: SW-29950 SEG 1 RANGO

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TJ LARKtlark@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 10896981Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06098751 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:03:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TJ LARK - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP372323 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 7877 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 137 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 985 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 231 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 29 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 630 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 971 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06098751 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:03:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TJ LARK - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO R100E 121011\Rear Axle [VCP372323] 16 Feb 2024 @ 7877.0 hrs

