
[[674850 LAKE CONWAY]] TAKEUCHI TL8 408004880 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP446889
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 674850 LAKE CONWAY

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. All other metal levels aretypical for a new componentbreaking in. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10896993Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06098763 (Generated: 02/26/2024 15:39:14) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP446889 VCP398544 --- ---Sample Date 19 Feb 2024 03 Feb 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 380 32 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 160 159 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.082 NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 19 11 --- ---Sodium ppm 5 5 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 819 397 --- ---Copper ppm 2 1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 9 6 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 11 7 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 25 9 --- ---Magnesium ppm 17 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 53 20 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 252 304 --- ---Barium ppm 11 14 --- ---Boron ppm 0 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06098763 (Generated: 02/26/2024 15:39:17) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL8 408004880\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP446889] 19 Feb 2024 @ 380.0 hrs

