
[[F02989 KR REZENDES]] VOLVO A35D 61262 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP439952
Oil Type: DEXRON III
Job No: F02989 KR REZENDES

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC31 JAMES P. MURPHY INDUSTRIAL HWYWEST WARWICK, RIUS  02893Contact: NORMAN VINCENTnorman.vincent@chadwick-baross.comT: (401)328-6967F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CHAWESRIUnique No: 10897017Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Feb 2024
Report Id: CHAWESRI [WUSCAR] 06098787 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:10:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NORMAN VINCENT - CHAWESRI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439952 --- --- ---Sample Date 22 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 15156 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 9 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 81 --- --- ---Copper ppm 249 --- --- ---Lead ppm 34 --- --- ---Tin ppm 15 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 20 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 190 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 34 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 292 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 97 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CHAWESRI [WUSCAR] 06098787 (Generated: 02/26/2024 16:10:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NORMAN VINCENT - CHAWESRI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35D 61262\Transmission (Auto) [VCP439952] 22 Feb 2024 @ 15156.0 hrs

