
[[433891 PATRICK OHMST]] VOLVO SD25D 194145 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP368539
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT (GREEN)
Job No: 433891 PATRICK OHMST

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
We recommend drain/flush system,and refill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. Sediment present. Glycoland nitrite levels are acceptable. ThepH level of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 10897070Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 28 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098840 (Generated: 02/28/2024 09:05:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP368539 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 8.69 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 560 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 55.3 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -47 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance sediment --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06098840 (Generated: 02/28/2024 09:05:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO SD25D 194145\Coolant [VCP368539] 11 Dec 2023 @ .0 hrs

