
[[390585]] CUMMINS G090019362 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP306496
Oil Type: HYBRID (HOAT) COOLANT
Job No: 390585

AJAX ENTERPRISES OF MICHIGAN LLC830 KIRTSTROY, MIUS  48084Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (248)244-3300F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Glycoland nitrite levels are acceptable. ThepH level of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: AJATROUnique No: 10898850Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 28 Feb 2024
Report Id: AJATRO [WUSCAR] 06100620 (Generated: 02/28/2024 13:52:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - AJATRO

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP306496 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1200 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 9.57 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 2516 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 53.1 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -43 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: AJATRO [WUSCAR] 06100620 (Generated: 02/28/2024 13:52:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - AJATRO
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CUMMINS CUMMINS G090019362\Coolant [VCP306496] 21 Feb 2024 @ 1200.0 hrs

