
[[SWO-069177]] TAKEUCHI TL6 406001662 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP444459
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SWO-069177

WHITAKER CONTRACTING692 CONVICT CAMP RDGUNTERSVILLE, ALUS  35976Contact: BROTHER WHITAKERBrotherWhitaker@whitaker-contracting.comT: (256)298-3905F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Fuel content negligible.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: WHIGUNUnique No: 10899514Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 29 Feb 2024
Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 06101284 (Generated: 02/29/2024 10:58:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444459 VCP380776 VCP376424 VCP357817Sample Date 20 Feb 2024 10 Jan 2023 10 Jul 2022 29 Mar 2022Machine Hours 3140 3027 2241 1812Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL SEVERE NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.2 11.2 14.7 13.9Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.2 8.5 9.3 10.4Oxidation (PA) % 89 73 102 91
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.9 1 2 1.3Nitration (PA) % 99 88 110 89Sulfation (PA) % 67 61 76 72Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 1.6 8.2 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 47 27 9 7Sodium ppm 4 3 3 2Potassium ppm 6 2 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 77 87 45 24Copper ppm 6 33 6 4Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 2 1 <1Aluminum ppm 21 44 5 3Chromium ppm 3 3 1 <1Molybdenum ppm 67 72 53 47Nickel ppm <1 2 1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 2Manganese ppm <1 2 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1933 1307 1680 1605Magnesium ppm 967 917 626 594Zinc ppm 1329 1192 1183 996Phosphorus ppm 1137 1002 919 888Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 27 38 40 62

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 06101284 (Generated: 02/29/2024 10:58:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL6 406001662\Diesel Engine [VCP444459] 20 Feb 2024 @ 3140.0 hrs

