
[[SW-30086 SEG 1 RANGO]] VOLVO R100E 121020 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP422760
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: SW-30086 SEG 1 RANGO

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TJ LARKtlark@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oiland perform a filter service on thiscomponent if not already done. Weadvise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.The copper level is severe.There is a high amount ofparticulates present in the oil.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The AN level is acceptablefor this fluid. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 10899787Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 29 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06101557 (Generated: 02/29/2024 10:45:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TJ LARK - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP422760 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4057 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.6 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.54 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Particles >4µm 65472 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 8777 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 348 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/20/16 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 42 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 --- --- ---Copper ppm 358 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 8 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1818 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 9 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 648 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 581 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06101557 (Generated: 02/29/2024 10:45:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TJ LARK - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO R100E 121020\Hydraulic System [VCP422760] 20 Feb 2024 @ 4057.0 hrs

