
[[SWA477490 MELDGAARD]] VOLVO EC350EL 314186 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP433154
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SWA477490 MELDGAARD

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5210 REESE ROADDAVIE, FLUS  33314Contact: N. FACEYnfacey@altaequipfl.comT: (954)581-4744F: (954)583-0318
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. We were unable to performa particle count due to a highconcentration of particles present inthis sample.All component wear ratesare normal. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0095Unique No: 10899790Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 29 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 06101560 (Generated: 02/29/2024 11:53:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: N. FACEY - VOLVO0095

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP433154 VCP433834 VCP404551 VCP326770Sample Date 09 Feb 2024 03 Oct 2023 28 Mar 2023 14 Sep 2021Machine Hours 2035 1490 984 455Oil Hours 0 0 0 1500Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.7 42.8 44.6 43.7Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.48 0.52 0.52 0.460
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm --- 7625 24394 9272Particles >6µm --- 673 5957 1267Particles >14µm --- 56 287 77ISO 4406:1999 (c) --- 20/17/13 22/20/15 20/17/13Silicon ppm 4 5 4 4Sodium ppm 0 0 0 <1Potassium ppm 0 1 1 5
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 0 3 1 2Copper ppm 39 44 25 17Lead ppm 0 <1 0 2Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 0 0 0 0Chromium ppm 1 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 0Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 42 56 61 65Magnesium ppm 1 1 5 0Zinc ppm 469 626 543 493Phosphorus ppm 359 488 413 414Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 06101560 (Generated: 02/29/2024 11:53:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: N. FACEY - VOLVO0095
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 314186\Hydraulic System [VCP433154] 09 Feb 2024 @ 2035.0 hrs

