
[[SWO-069917 APAC]] VOLVO L150H 5908 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP441647
Oil Type: TRANSAXLE OIL SAE 75W80
Job No: SWO-069917 APAC

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY2238 PINSON VALLEY PARKWAYBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35217Contact: BRANTLY CLAYbclay@cowin.comT: F: (205)856-2106
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8528Unique No: 10900261Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 28 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8528 [WUSCAR] 06102031 (Generated: 02/28/2024 15:40:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANTLY CLAY - VOLVO8528

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441647 VCP297124 VCP290752 VCP285698Sample Date 22 Feb 2024 05 Feb 2021 18 Nov 2020 24 Aug 2020Machine Hours 7119 4099 3253 3140Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd N/ASample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 54.2 40.6 40.3 40.1
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 4 12 9 13Sodium ppm 1 3 2 2Potassium ppm 0 0 3 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 19 274 123 201Copper ppm 6 33 31 33Lead ppm 0 0 <1 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 1 <1 0Chromium ppm <1 6 2 5Molybdenum ppm <1 4 <1 3Nickel ppm 0 1 2 2Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 6 2 5Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3080 3864 3587 3614Magnesium ppm 28 7 8 9Zinc ppm 1324 1457 1444 1550Phosphorus ppm 1261 1329 1274 1208Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 18 117 89 155

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8528 [WUSCAR] 06102031 (Generated: 02/28/2024 15:40:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANTLY CLAY - VOLVO8528
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 5908\Front Axle [VCP441647] 22 Feb 2024 @ 7119.0 hrs

