
[[SWO-069177]] TAKEUCHI TL6 406001662 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP444471
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: SWO-069177

WHITAKER CONTRACTING692 CONVICT CAMP RDGUNTERSVILLE, ALUS  35976Contact: BROTHER WHITAKERBrotherWhitaker@whitaker-contracting.comT: (256)298-3905F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Weadvise that you check for the sourceof water entry. The oil change at thetime of sampling has been noted. Weadvise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. There is amoderate concentration of waterpresent in the oil. The oil viscosity ishigher than normal. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: WHIGUNUnique No: 10900284Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 29 Feb 2024
Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 06102054 (Generated: 02/29/2024 15:03:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444471 VCP380773 VCP372892 VCP357818Sample Date 20 Feb 2024 10 Jan 2023 10 Jul 2022 29 Mar 2022Machine Hours 3140 3027 2241 1812Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status SEVERE ATTENTION ABNORMAL SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 5228 157 338 274
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.409 NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 2044 14 111 95Sodium ppm 48 3 2 4Potassium ppm 288 0 15 12
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9424 353 1194 1558Copper ppm 21 <1 6 3Lead ppm 2 0 <1 0Tin ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 582 2 39 27Chromium ppm 97 4 11 13Molybdenum ppm 14 <1 1 3Nickel ppm 16 <1 2 3Titanium ppm 37 <1 2 2Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 82 4 8 11Vanadium ppm 1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4943 18 517 536Magnesium ppm 1133 2 101 97Zinc ppm 98 0 22 58Phosphorus ppm 812 243 504 899Barium ppm 7 0 0 0Boron ppm 120 4 71 117

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 06102054 (Generated: 02/29/2024 15:03:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL6 406001662\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP444471] 20 Feb 2024 @ 3140.0 hrs

