
[[SUPERIOR]] VOLVO A25G 740348 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP440048
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SUPERIOR

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal.Additive levels indicate the additionof a different brand, or type of oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10900829Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 29 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06102599 (Generated: 02/29/2024 20:39:18) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440048 VCP0007708 VCP340561 ---Sample Date 09 Feb 2024 05 May 2023 09 Nov 2021 ---Machine Hours 11358 0 8776 ---Oil Hours 0 0 1500 ---Oil Changed N/A N/A Changed ---Sample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 272 277 285 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 9 9 15 ---Sodium ppm 1 0 0 ---Potassium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 205 166 249 ---Copper ppm 18 17 24 ---Lead ppm <1 0 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 1 ---Aluminum ppm <1 0 3 ---Chromium ppm 1 2 3 ---Molybdenum ppm 1 2 3 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 2 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 2 2 2 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 231 148 112 ---Magnesium ppm 5 12 20 ---Zinc ppm 122 94 67 ---Phosphorus ppm 1082 1007 972 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 167 162 152 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06102599 (Generated: 02/29/2024 20:39:21) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 740348\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP440048] 09 Feb 2024 @ 11358.0 hrs

