
VOLVO L110H 631231 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP440168
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No:

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: PM ServicesPMServices@ripaconstruction.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition. NOTE: one of two samplesreceived with same ID and samplingdate.Gear wear is indicated. There is alight concentration of water presentin the oil. Elemental level of silicon(Si) above normal. The condition ofthe oil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10900830Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 29 Feb 2024
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06102600 (Generated: 02/29/2024 20:37:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440168 VCP432009 VCP435650 VCP420256Sample Date 20 Feb 2024 20 Feb 2024 08 Nov 2023 28 Apr 2023Machine Hours 12527 12827 12029 10851Oil Hours 0 0 0 2000Oil Changed Changed N/A Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.8 41.5 43.08 43.5
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.344 NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 117 14 12 17Sodium ppm 2 1 3 5Potassium ppm <1 <1 0 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 465 57 24 125Copper ppm <1 0 <1 0Lead ppm 2 2 0 0Tin ppm <1 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 5 <1 <1 2Chromium ppm 3 0 0 2Molybdenum ppm 2 <1 <1 2Nickel ppm 2 0 0 1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 <1 <1 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4002 4622 4060 4103Magnesium ppm 17 25 21 14Zinc ppm 1539 1972 1550 1629Phosphorus ppm 1316 1558 1246 1280Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 128 137 132 141

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06102600 (Generated: 02/29/2024 20:37:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631231\Front Axle [VCP440168] 20 Feb 2024 @ 12527.0 hrs

