
VOLVO A40G 353142 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP435612
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No:

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: PM ServicesPMServices@ripaconstruction.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The filter change at thetime of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Moderate concentrationof visible metal present. Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the fluid. Thefluid viscosity is lower than normal.Additive levels indicate the additionof a different brand, or type of fluid.Confirm oil type.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10900856Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 29 Feb 2024
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06102626 (Generated: 02/29/2024 20:49:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435612 VCP416305 VCP406904 VCP397279Sample Date 21 Feb 2024 18 Aug 2023 12 Apr 2023 10 Jan 2023Machine Hours 3175 2126 1624 0Oil Hours 0 0 1624 1000Oil Changed N/A Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 29.1 28.1 28.4 32.3
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 5 16 6 4Sodium ppm 5 6 4 4Potassium ppm 2 4 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 18 42 39 17Copper ppm 10 25 9 8Lead ppm 1 0 0 0Tin ppm 1 4 <1 2Aluminum ppm 12 24 6 10Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Molybdenum ppm 0 0 <1 0Nickel ppm 0 3 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 5 6 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 128 77 70 71Magnesium ppm 2 0 1 0Zinc ppm 34 0 18 <1Phosphorus ppm 201 203 188 185Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 82 77 89 88

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06102626 (Generated: 02/29/2024 20:49:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 353142\Transmission (Auto) [VCP435612] 21 Feb 2024 @ 3175.0 hrs

