
[[673801]] VOLVO ECR145E 314441 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP440684
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 673801

BLAZE CONSTRUCTION5640 ST JEAN STDETROIT, MIUS  48213Contact: DAVE WARDdward@blazecontracting.netT: (248)632-2317F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: BLADETUnique No: 10900929Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 29 Feb 2024
Report Id: BLADET [WUSCAR] 06102699 (Generated: 02/29/2024 21:00:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE WARD - BLADET

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440684 VCP396823 VCP354612 VCP315729Sample Date 21 Feb 2024 28 Dec 2022 19 May 2022 13 Sep 2021Machine Hours 3640 2450 2007 1499Oil Hours 600 500 500 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.0 13.2 13.0 12.6Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.9 10.2 11.3 ---Oxidation (PA) % 60 62 84 79
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.3 0.3 0.3Nitration (PA) % 61 64 68 66Sulfation (PA) % 52 52 62 61Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 6 7 6Sodium ppm 1 <1 2 1Potassium ppm 1 2 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 18 15 18 12Copper ppm 3 2 3 2Lead ppm <1 1 <1 <1Tin ppm 1 1 1 1Aluminum ppm 4 5 5 3Chromium ppm 2 1 1 <1Molybdenum ppm 61 58 42 38Nickel ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 1Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1024 1295 1696 1716Magnesium ppm 952 990 510 533Zinc ppm 1226 1361 1166 1116Phosphorus ppm 975 1055 952 923Barium ppm 1 0 0 0Boron ppm <1 5 50 45

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BLADET [WUSCAR] 06102699 (Generated: 02/29/2024 21:00:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE WARD - BLADET
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR145E 314441\Diesel Engine [VCP440684] 21 Feb 2024 @ 3640.0 hrs

