
[[A12083]] VOLVO L120H 632331 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP405607
Oil Type: MOBIL HYDRAULIC OIL AW 46
Job No: A12083

WASTE MANAGEMENT - TELFORD400 PROGRESS DRTELFORD, PAUS  18969-1191Contact: EDWARD ROGENERerogener@wm.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a light amount ofsilt (particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: WASTELUnique No: 10901127Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 29 Feb 2024
Report Id: WASTEL [WUSCAR] 06102897 (Generated: 02/29/2024 12:32:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EDWARD ROGENER - WASTEL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP405607 VCP434856 VCP424771 VCP418602Sample Date 20 Feb 2024 05 Dec 2023 28 Aug 2023 14 Jun 2023Machine Hours 12465 12000 11470 10995Oil Hours 500 4000 3500 1000Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.0 41.2 41.2 41.4Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.573 0.47 0.33 0.38
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 10639 6571 3827 3744Particles >6µm 2554 763 887 1100Particles >14µm 160 64 52 109ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/19/14 20/17/13 19/17/13 19/17/14Silicon ppm 2 2 3 2Sodium ppm 4 5 5 6Potassium ppm 1 1 0 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 8 7 6Copper ppm 2 3 3 3Lead ppm <1 <1 1 1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm <1 2 1 <1Chromium ppm 2 6 5 5Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 146 95 127 95Magnesium ppm 18 13 14 12Zinc ppm 440 450 466 441Phosphorus ppm 341 393 370 352Barium ppm 0 6 0 0Boron ppm 3 0 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WASTEL [WUSCAR] 06102897 (Generated: 02/29/2024 12:32:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EDWARD ROGENER - WASTEL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632331\Hydraulic System [VCP405607] 20 Feb 2024 @ 12465.0 hrs

