
[[74848 LAKE CONWAY]] VOLVO L20H 1220189 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP445681
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 74848 LAKE CONWAY

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
The oil is near the end of it`s usefulservice life, recommend schedule anoil change. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.The amount and size of particulatespresent in the system are acceptable.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The AN levelis at the top-end of therecommended limit.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10901142Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 01 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06102912 (Generated: 03/01/2024 10:06:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP445681 VCP385465 VCP346555 VCP326077Sample Date 20 Feb 2024 14 Oct 2022 02 Mar 2022 23 Aug 2021Machine Hours 3401 2655 2089 971Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 39.4 41.5 41.5 30.6Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 1.68 0.50 0.42 0.252
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 4843 1150 4972 1022Particles >6µm 1204 102 144 105Particles >14µm 30 8 12 7ISO 4406:1999 (c) 19/17/12 17/14/10 19/14/11 17/14/10Silicon ppm 1 2 3 0Sodium ppm 2 1 2 1Potassium ppm 2 0 0 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 4 25 16Copper ppm 2 1 8 7Lead ppm 1 0 3 2Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm <1 0 <1 <1Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 6 10 <1 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 193 200 43 37Magnesium ppm 70 77 0 0Zinc ppm 376 388 319 316Phosphorus ppm 315 332 343 288Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 4 0 <1 3

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06102912 (Generated: 03/01/2024 10:06:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L20H 1220189\Hydraulic System [VCP445681] 20 Feb 2024 @ 3401.0 hrs

