
[TMR-ROCKLEDGE [75200]] 94142 VOLVO L90G 3184 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP446587
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 75200

TRADEMARK METALS RECYCLILNG - COCOA BEACH490 ANSIN ROADROCKLEDGE, FLUS  32955Contact: RYAN BOWDEN
T: F: (321)631-5808
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: TRAROCFLUnique No: 10901588Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 29 Feb 2024
Report Id: TRAROCFL [WUSCAR] 06103358 (Generated: 03/04/2024 09:34:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAROCFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP446587 VCP411731 VCP385406 VCP349467Sample Date 21 Feb 2024 31 May 2023 11 Oct 2022 20 Jan 2022Machine Hours 10646 10091 9569 9217Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.7 42.7 42.6 41.4
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 21 15 16 12Sodium ppm 9 8 8 2Potassium ppm 2 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 71 21 19 32Copper ppm 7 2 2 1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 <1 1 1Chromium ppm 1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 <1 1 11Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4421 3794 3962 3810Magnesium ppm 30 26 26 21Zinc ppm 1845 1578 1610 1368Phosphorus ppm 1276 1209 1263 1269Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 141 140 140 129

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRAROCFL [WUSCAR] 06103358 (Generated: 03/04/2024 09:34:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAROCFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 94142 VOLVO L90G 3184\Front Axle [VCP446587] 21 Feb 2024 @ 10646.0 hrs

