
[[672669]] VOLVO L90H 626530 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP444093
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: 672669

OLDCASTLE LAWN AND GARDEN2427 RWS RANCH RDDAVENPORT, FLUS  33837Contact: DAVID ORTIZdavid.ortiz@oldcastle.comT: (800)833-2984F: (863)421-1776
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: GREDAVFLUnique No: 10901630Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 04 Mar 2024
Report Id: GREDAVFL [WUSCAR] 06103400 (Generated: 03/04/2024 11:12:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID ORTIZ - GREDAVFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444093 VCP424438 VCP402759 ---Sample Date 05 Feb 2024 12 Jun 2023 20 Feb 2023 ---Machine Hours 2534 1297 546 ---Oil Hours 2534 1297 546 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.67 27.9 27.3 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 13 9 8 ---Sodium ppm 6 0 3 ---Potassium ppm 3 3 2 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 303 176 95 ---Copper ppm 12 9 6 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 0 0 ---Chromium ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm 1 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 1 ---Manganese ppm 13 10 9 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 86 78 75 ---Magnesium ppm 2 <1 <1 ---Zinc ppm 43 30 15 ---Phosphorus ppm 206 188 186 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 65 72 69 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GREDAVFL [WUSCAR] 06103400 (Generated: 03/04/2024 11:12:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID ORTIZ - GREDAVFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 626530\Transmission (Auto) [VCP444093] 05 Feb 2024 @ 2534.0 hrs

