
[[74]] VOLVO ECR235DL 210480 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VC527564
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: 74

DUNN COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENTROUTE 2 BOX 71A, 3303 US HWY 12 EASTMENOMONIE, WIUS  54751Contact: DANNY NELSONdnelson@co.dunn.wi.usT: (715)232-2361F: (715)232-3888
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.An increase in the iron levelis noted. Cylinder, crank, or cam shaftwear is indicated. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: DUNMENUnique No: 10901692Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 02 Mar 2024
Report Id: DUNMEN [WUSCAR] 06103462 (Generated: 03/02/2024 10:15:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANNY NELSON - DUNMEN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VC527564 VC527533 VC527553 VC527541Sample Date 15 Feb 2024 30 Mar 2023 30 Nov 2021 27 May 2021Machine Hours 3838 3643 700 3037Oil Hours 195 118 205 156Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 12.6 13.3 13.0Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.8 9.4 10.5 ---Oxidation (PA) % 57 61 76 69
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.2Nitration (PA) % 53 51 48 58Sulfation (PA) % 50 53 60 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 13 9 10 6Sodium ppm 3 1 2 2Potassium ppm <1 <1 3 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 167 37 4 27Copper ppm 2 0 2 <1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 6 2 2 3Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 30 34 37 37Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1904 1807 1741 1623Magnesium ppm 359 356 542 534Zinc ppm 1039 1009 916 974Phosphorus ppm 909 802 812 843Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 29 43 69 152

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DUNMEN [WUSCAR] 06103462 (Generated: 03/02/2024 10:15:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANNY NELSON - DUNMEN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235DL 210480\Diesel Engine [VC527564] 15 Feb 2024 @ 3838.0 hrs

