
VOLVO L150H 6989 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP432774
Oil Type: VALVOLINE ALLFLEET 10W
Job No:

CITY CARTING221 OLD GATE LNMILFORD, CTUS  06460Contact: TAVINS BANKStavins@citycart.netT: (203)223-3885F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend you service the filters onthis component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount ofparticulates present in the oil. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CITMILCONUnique No: 10902497Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 02 Mar 2024
Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06104267 (Generated: 03/02/2024 12:38:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAVINS BANKS - CITMILCON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432774 VCP411572 --- ---Sample Date 22 Feb 2024 02 Oct 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 6479 5387 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.2 42.4 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.74 0.37 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Particles >4µm 121549 2354 --- ---Particles >6µm 29739 734 --- ---Particles >14µm 1949 50 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/22/18 18/17/13 --- ---Silicon ppm 4 1 --- ---Sodium ppm 6 4 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 2 --- ---Copper ppm 2 3 --- ---Lead ppm 2 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 0 --- ---Chromium ppm 3 4 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 6 0 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1729 49 --- ---Magnesium ppm 52 1 --- ---Zinc ppm 1044 410 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 843 325 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 13 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06104267 (Generated: 03/02/2024 12:38:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAVINS BANKS - CITMILCON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6989\Hydraulic System [VCP432774] 22 Feb 2024 @ 6479.0 hrs

