
[[SW0-070027]] VOLVO L180H 5715 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP445321
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: SW0-070027

DUNN CONSTRUCTION INC318 N 14TH STBELLEVUE, IAUS  52031Contact: STEVE DUNNDUNNCONSTRUCTINC@GMAIL.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of oil entry. We recommenddrain/flush system, and refill with50/50 antifreeze water mixture.Please note that the coolant was toocontaminated to perform the normallaboratory tests. There is a highamount of oil present in the coolant.Suspect engine oil. The coolant is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: DUNBELUnique No: 10902968Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 01 Mar 2024
Report Id: DUNBEL [WUSCAR] 06104738 (Generated: 03/01/2024 08:55:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE DUNN - DUNBEL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP445321 VCP441230 VCP0004653 ---Sample Date 27 Feb 2024 08 Feb 2024 21 Jul 2023 ---Machine Hours 0 1600 670 ---Sample Status SEVERE SEVERE NORMAL ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 --- --- 7.71 ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm --- --- NT ---Percentage Glycol % --- --- 44.0 ---Freezing Point °C --- --- -21 ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance oil oil normal ---Coolant Color --- --- Yllow ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DUNBEL [WUSCAR] 06104738 (Generated: 03/01/2024 08:55:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEVE DUNN - DUNBEL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5715\Coolant [VCP445321] 27 Feb 2024 @ .0 hrs

