
[[SW-29953 SEG 1 RANGO]] VOLVO R100E 121019 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP299767
Oil Type: GEAR OIL LS 80W90
Job No: SW-29953 SEG 1 RANGO

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TONY PAYANtpayan@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)GEAR OIL LS 80W90.  Please confirm. All component wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 10903726Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 02 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06105496 (Generated: 03/02/2024 00:20:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP299767 --- --- ---Sample Date 26 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3292 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 125 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 998 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 226 --- --- ---Copper ppm 8 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 169 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 7 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 73 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 405 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 881 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06105496 (Generated: 03/02/2024 00:20:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO R100E 121019\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP299767] 26 Feb 2024 @ 3292.0 hrs

