
[[135666 DUFFIELD]] VOLVO A40G 340937 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP413745
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 135666 DUFFIELD

THE GW VAN KEPPEL CO1876 NORTH 105TH EAST AVENUETULSA, OKUS  74116Contact: MIKE DEVOREMDEVORE@VANKEPPEL.COMT: (918)836-8851F: (918)834-1659
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0053Unique No: 10903865Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 03 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0053 [WUSCAR] 06105635 (Generated: 03/03/2024 19:35:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DEVORE - VOLVO0053

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413745 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 11284 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status MARGINAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 31.6 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 24 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 99 --- --- ---Copper ppm 21 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 5 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 38 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 286 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 105 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 230 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 48 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0053 [WUSCAR] 06105635 (Generated: 03/03/2024 19:35:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DEVORE - VOLVO0053
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 340937\Transmission (Auto) [VCP413745] 27 Feb 2024 @ 11284.0 hrs

