
VOLVO L90H 625695 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP315208
Oil Type: VOLVO HYD OIL 68
Job No:

LEHIGH CAREER CENTER & TECHNICAL INSTITUE4500 EDUCATION PARK DRSCHNECKSVILLE, PAUS  18078Contact: JIM WABALSwabalsj@mylct.orgT: (610)799-1433F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a moderate amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. Viscosity of sampleindicates oil is within ISO 46 range,advise investigate. Confirm oil type.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid.

Depot: LEHSCHUnique No: 10909492Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 05 Mar 2024
Report Id: LEHSCH [WUSCAR] 06105995 (Generated: 03/05/2024 11:55:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM WABALS - LEHSCH

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP315208 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 Feb 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 483 --- --- ---Oil Hours 483 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.5 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.45 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Particles >4µm 32825 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 3121 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 16 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/19/11 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 58 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 390 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 309 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEHSCH [WUSCAR] 06105995 (Generated: 03/05/2024 11:55:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM WABALS - LEHSCH
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 625695\Hydraulic System [VCP315208] 23 Feb 2024 @ 483.0 hrs

