
[[SWA491958 RENTAL]] VOLVO DD120C 288141 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP376836
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SWA491958 RENTAL

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a light amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 10909497Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 04 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06106000 (Generated: 03/04/2024 15:46:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP376836 VCP368728 VCP320135 ---Sample Date 23 Feb 2024 31 Mar 2023 15 Sep 2021 ---Machine Hours 2854 1917 746 ---Oil Hours 854 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.1 43.7 44.7 ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.46 0.10 0.109 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Particles >4µm 5965 86445 --- ---Particles >6µm 1287 12567 --- ---Particles >14µm 124 266 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/17/14 24/21/15 --- ---Silicon ppm 1 1 <1 ---Sodium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Potassium ppm 0 2 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 8 5 ---Copper ppm 4 2 9 ---Lead ppm 0 3 2 ---Tin ppm 0 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 0 0 4 ---Chromium ppm 0 0 0 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 68 111 121 ---Magnesium ppm 0 4 <1 ---Zinc ppm 288 65 48 ---Phosphorus ppm 336 412 457 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 1 0 1 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06106000 (Generated: 03/04/2024 15:46:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO DD120C 288141\Hydraulic System [VCP376836] 23 Feb 2024 @ 2854.0 hrs

