
[[SPM675624]] VOLVO EC250ELR 314201 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP444424
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM675624

BELSON STEEL1685 N STATE RTE 50BOURBONNAIS, ILUS  60914Contact: M. POZANmpozan@belsonsteel.comT: (815)932-7416F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: BELBOUUnique No: 10930029Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 19 Mar 2024
Report Id: BELBOU [WUSCAR] 06121196 (Generated: 03/19/2024 15:56:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: M. POZAN - BELBOU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444424 VCP423129 VCP346074 ---Sample Date 04 Mar 2024 21 Jul 2023 02 Apr 2022 ---Machine Hours 3690 2533 527 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 148 149 163 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 9 14 6 ---Sodium ppm 1 2 1 ---Potassium ppm 1 2 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 334 304 203 ---Copper ppm 10 10 14 ---Lead ppm 0 <1 0 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm <1 2 1 ---Chromium ppm 2 3 2 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 1 1 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm 3 4 4 ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 56 20 16 ---Magnesium ppm 1 6 0 ---Zinc ppm 32 18 14 ---Phosphorus ppm 492 505 314 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 7 8 <1 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BELBOU [WUSCAR] 06121196 (Generated: 03/19/2024 15:56:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: M. POZAN - BELBOU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250ELR 314201\Swing Drive [VCP444424] 04 Mar 2024 @ 3690.0 hrs

