
[[SW-31414-2 CASTLE VA]] VOLVO EC220EL 310178 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP446681
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SW-31414-2 CASTLE VA

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TONY PAYANtpayan@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 10937604Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 22 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06123453 (Generated: 03/22/2024 13:06:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP446681 VCP412191 VCP383477 VCP354160Sample Date 12 Mar 2024 07 Sep 2023 04 Jan 2023 12 Jul 2022Machine Hours 6753 6228 5709 5043Oil Hours 525 500 700 600Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.4 14.6 14.4 14.4Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.1 8.1 9.1 10.0Oxidation (PA) % 78 83 80 101
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.2 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 79 86 81 97Sulfation (PA) % 61 63 63 71Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 8 13 6Sodium ppm 2 2 <1 1Potassium ppm 1 0 <1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 8 12 8Copper ppm 1 1 2 <1Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 1Tin ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 3 4 2 2Chromium ppm 1 <1 1 <1Molybdenum ppm 85 89 87 79Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1260 1368 1364 1645Magnesium ppm 890 988 930 699Zinc ppm 1170 1208 1243 1134Phosphorus ppm 975 1009 1019 919Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 86 86 93 100

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06123453 (Generated: 03/22/2024 13:06:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220EL 310178\Diesel Engine [VCP446681] 12 Mar 2024 @ 6753.0 hrs

