
[[511389]] VOLVO L70H 622630 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP455294
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 511389

WASTE MANAGEMENT4986 LB MCLEOD RD.ORLANDO, FLUS  32811Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (407)481-2530F: (407)843-0614
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: WASORLUnique No: 10937607Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 22 Mar 2024
Report Id: WASORL [WUSCAR] 06123456 (Generated: 03/22/2024 13:04:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - WASORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP455294 VCP435105 VCP417629 VCP421048Sample Date 19 Mar 2024 15 Dec 2023 07 Jul 2023 16 May 2023Machine Hours 11764 11214 10741 10311Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed N/A Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 12.9 13.2 13.3Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.9 10.3 10.0 9.9Oxidation (PA) % 82 82 85 85
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.4 0.3 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 65 60 60 61Sulfation (PA) % 59 61 61 63Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 17 16 15 11Sodium ppm 2 2 2 0Potassium ppm 1 2 <1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 5 6 7Copper ppm 1 <1 1 <1Lead ppm <1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 12 11 5 3Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 42 42 43 46Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1713 1667 1844 1702Magnesium ppm 495 533 569 511Zinc ppm 1128 1172 1236 1135Phosphorus ppm 956 968 988 921Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 29 30 30 29

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WASORL [WUSCAR] 06123456 (Generated: 03/22/2024 13:04:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - WASORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 622630\Diesel Engine [VCP455294] 19 Mar 2024 @ 11764.0 hrs

