
[[1764]] SENNEBOGEN 835 835.5.2560 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP437830
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 1764

SIMS METAL130 NORTH 12TH STSACRAMENTO, CAUS  95814Contact: EVERT
T: (916)769-7864F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: SIMSACCAUnique No: 10937616Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 22 Mar 2024
Report Id: SIMSACCA [WUSCAR] 06123465 (Generated: 03/22/2024 13:14:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EVERT ? - SIMSACCA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437830 VCP404699 VCP293617 ---Sample Date 09 Mar 2024 21 Apr 2023 23 Dec 2020 ---Machine Hours 7742 6200 2436 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 12.7 13.2 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.4 7.8 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 110 98 93 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Soot % % 0.2 0.2 0.3 ---Nitration (PA) % 97 82 93 ---Sulfation (PA) % 69 62 70 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 6 6 3 ---Sodium ppm 3 4 4 ---Potassium ppm 6 9 12 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 12 20 ---Copper ppm 3 2 2 ---Lead ppm <1 1 0 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm 4 2 5 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 42 41 44 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 13 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1793 1712 1518 ---Magnesium ppm 527 520 711 ---Zinc ppm 1198 1226 774 ---Phosphorus ppm 993 980 649 ---Barium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Boron ppm 32 35 44 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMSACCA [WUSCAR] 06123465 (Generated: 03/22/2024 13:14:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EVERT ? - SIMSACCA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835 835.5.2560\Diesel Engine [VCP437830] 09 Mar 2024 @ 7742.0 hrs

