
[[660719 STONE CO]] VOLVO L260H 1244 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP453966
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 660719 STONE CO

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL CONZpaul.conz@altg.comT: (313)348-8861F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate amount of silt (particulates< 14 microns in size) present in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The oil is still serviceableprovided that the contaminant(s) canbe reduced to acceptable levels.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10937726Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 24 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06123575 (Generated: 03/24/2024 23:22:58) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP453966 VCP407927 VCP366079 VCP312707Sample Date 14 Mar 2024 08 Jun 2023 21 Sep 2022 15 Nov 2021Machine Hours 7815 5879 4004 2006Oil Hours 4000 2000 4000 2006Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ATTENTION ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.2 41.2 41.3 42.0Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.40 0.43 0.34 0.339
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 29683 7824 27703 29731Particles >6µm 5435 2224 8680 7345Particles >14µm 367 149 975 619ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/20/16 20/18/14 22/20/17 22/20/16Silicon ppm 4 3 2 1Sodium ppm 4 1 4 0Potassium ppm <1 <1 7 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 4 4 3Copper ppm 2 1 2 2Lead ppm <1 <1 2 1Tin ppm <1 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 2 1 0 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 0Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 31 30 45 51Magnesium ppm 3 2 6 <1Zinc ppm 422 450 305 472Phosphorus ppm 332 337 280 327Barium ppm 0 2 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 <1 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06123575 (Generated: 03/24/2024 23:23:01) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L260H 1244\Hydraulic System [VCP453966] 14 Mar 2024 @ 7815.0 hrs

