
[[1754 I PULL U PULL]] VOLVO L90H 623027 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP397916
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 1754 I PULL U PULL

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT8594 FRUITRIDGE ROADSACRAMENTO, CAUS  95826Contact: RAY KRANZUSCHray.kranzusch@vcesvolvo.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO4485Unique No: 10938219Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 22 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO4485 [WUSCAR] 06124068 (Generated: 03/22/2024 20:43:10) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: RAY KRANZUSCH - VOLVO4485

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP397916 VCP296768 VCP263841 ---Sample Date 12 Mar 2024 01 Apr 2021 11 Aug 2020 ---Machine Hours 12500 10653 9360 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.0 94.7 40.3 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 14 6 12 ---Sodium ppm 5 2 2 ---Potassium ppm 2 <1 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 23 18 24 ---Copper ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Lead ppm <1 0 0 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 17 0 ---Chromium ppm <1 1 0 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 43 <1 ---Nickel ppm <1 0 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2595 1798 3204 ---Magnesium ppm 13 518 13 ---Zinc ppm 1157 1164 1366 ---Phosphorus ppm 853 1029 1090 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 80 33 141 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4485 [WUSCAR] 06124068 (Generated: 03/22/2024 20:43:12) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: RAY KRANZUSCH - VOLVO4485
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 623027\Front Axle [VCP397916] 12 Mar 2024 @ 12500.0 hrs

