
[[687947 ATLAS ORG]] VOLVO L70H 623753 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP455077
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: 687947 ATLAS ORG

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain thefluid from the component if this hasnot already been done. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.The iron level is severe.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. The fluid isno longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10938271Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06124120 (Generated: 03/23/2024 11:24:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP455077 VCP432901 VCP418337 VCP417833Sample Date 13 Mar 2024 21 Dec 2023 12 Sep 2023 29 Jun 2023Machine Hours 8707 8081 7300 6718Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status SEVERE NORMAL SEVERE SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.4 27.56 27.6 26.6
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 10 2 9 17Sodium ppm 7 1 8 11Potassium ppm 3 2 2 4
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 352 4 335 677Copper ppm 10 6 9 15Lead ppm <1 <1 0 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 10 0 7 8Chromium ppm 1 1 <1 2Molybdenum ppm 1 0 <1 1Nickel ppm 1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 7 <1 6 14Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 131 14 145 218Magnesium ppm 3 0 0 4Zinc ppm 72 240 31 136Phosphorus ppm 172 299 219 230Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 40 0 53 29

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06124120 (Generated: 03/23/2024 11:24:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 623753\Transmission (Auto) [VCP455077] 13 Mar 2024 @ 8707.0 hrs

