
[[SWO-070465]] EPIROC T45 AVO14A1117 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP454219
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: SWO-070465

WHITAKER CONTRACTING692 CONVICT CAMP RDGUNTERSVILLE, ALUS  35976Contact: BROTHER WHITAKERBrotherWhitaker@whitaker-contracting.comT: (256)298-3905F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: WHIGUNUnique No: 10939396Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 25 Mar 2024
Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 06125245 (Generated: 03/25/2024 13:39:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454219 VCP418150 VCP402488 VCP253584Sample Date 14 Mar 2024 24 Jul 2023 16 Mar 2023 25 Jun 2020Machine Hours 1217 11559 10872 8983Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 291 262 287 286
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 128 24 51 19Sodium ppm 2 1 4 4Potassium ppm 0 1 3 5
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 461 96 175 125Copper ppm 85 10 20 31Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 4 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 5 4 10 2Chromium ppm 5 1 3 3Molybdenum ppm 4 5 <1 1Nickel ppm 1 0 <1 1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm 3 <1 2 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 121 113 120 153Magnesium ppm 22 25 11 4Zinc ppm 79 94 83 70Phosphorus ppm 1034 957 966 697Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 126 155 130 28

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 06125245 (Generated: 03/25/2024 13:39:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	EPIROC EPIROC T45 AVO14A1117\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP454219] 14 Mar 2024 @ 1217.0 hrs

