
VOLVO L150F 14323 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCE030481
Oil Type: PHILLIPS 66 15W40
Job No:

GRAND COUNTY ROAD AND BRIDGEPO BOX 9GRANBY, COUS  80446Contact: ZAC BROADYzbroady@co.grand.co.usT: (970)887-2123F: (970)887-3168
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: GRAGRAVCEUnique No: 10939518Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 24 Mar 2024
Report Id: GRAGRAVCE [WUSCAR] 06125367 (Generated: 03/24/2024 18:50:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ZAC BROADY - GRAGRAVCE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE030481 VCE01802 VCE232863 VCE232889Sample Date 18 Dec 2023 11 Jan 2023 14 Jan 2022 05 Nov 2020Machine Hours 4511 4259 4057 3767Oil Hours 252 202 290 250Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 13.3 13.5 13.2Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.8 8.1 9.7 ---Oxidation (PA) % 59 57 62 55
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.2 0.3 0.3Nitration (PA) % 50 49 70 63Sulfation (PA) % 56 56 61 57Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 4 3 5Sodium ppm 0 2 3 4Potassium ppm 2 0 3 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 4 7 5Copper ppm 2 3 7 5Lead ppm <1 1 2 0Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 3 2 2 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 94 76 8 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm <1 0 <1 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1492 1375 1386 1402Magnesium ppm 384 430 735 805Zinc ppm 1215 1189 1223 1146Phosphorus ppm 987 985 1140 990Barium ppm 2 0 0 0Boron ppm 454 435 125 84

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GRAGRAVCE [WUSCAR] 06125367 (Generated: 03/24/2024 18:51:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ZAC BROADY - GRAGRAVCE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150F 14323\Diesel Engine [VCE030481] 18 Dec 2023 @ 4511.0 hrs

