
VOLVO ECR145EL 311251 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP444350
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No:

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: PM ServicesPMServices@ripaconstruction.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. We advise thatyou follow the  water drain-offprocedure for this component.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Appearance is milky.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10940886Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Mar 2024
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06126735 (Generated: 03/26/2024 17:17:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444350 VCP374608 --- ---Sample Date 06 Mar 2024 13 Jun 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 2772 1890 --- ---Oil Hours 0 1500 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 249 187 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 1.31 NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 28 17 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 666 748 --- ---Copper ppm 43 37 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 5 --- ---Chromium ppm 7 6 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 8 9 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 121 <1 --- ---Magnesium ppm 26 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 115 96 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 842 432 --- ---Barium ppm 1 4 --- ---Boron ppm 79 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06126735 (Generated: 03/26/2024 17:17:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR145EL 311251\Swing Drive [VCP444350] 06 Mar 2024 @ 2772.0 hrs

