
[[TRANSPORT LEASING]] VOLVO L220H 3069 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP440141
Oil Type: MOBIL ATF
Job No: TRANSPORT LEASING

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY464 WASHINGTON STREET STWIN FALLS, IDUS  83301Contact: JANAE HYMASjhymas@arnoldmachinery.comT: (208)733-1715F: (775)356-7152
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The iron levelis severe. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO1835Unique No: 10940934Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO1835 [WUSCAR] 06126783 (Generated: 03/26/2024 17:18:47) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: JANAE HYMAS - VOLVO1835

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440141 VCP339793 VCP322322 VCP263615Sample Date 27 Feb 2024 11 Apr 2022 24 Sep 2021 21 Jan 2020Machine Hours 15532 10745 7950 3734Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ChangedSample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 25.4 25.9 28.1 29.5
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 7 4 5 11Sodium ppm 2 4 4 6Potassium ppm 2 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 315 195 142 108Copper ppm 14 8 7 9Lead ppm <1 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 3 2 2 2Chromium ppm 2 1 1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 1 1 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 6 4 3 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 128 122 151 761Magnesium ppm 11 8 11 11Zinc ppm 32 23 28 288Phosphorus ppm 190 212 221 347Barium ppm 0 0 0 3Boron ppm 78 76 79 57

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1835 [WUSCAR] 06126783 (Generated: 03/26/2024 17:18:50) Rev: 2 Contact/Location: JANAE HYMAS - VOLVO1835
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3069\Transmission (Auto) [VCP440141] 27 Feb 2024 @ 15532.0 hrs

