
[[24929]] VOLVO L220H 3130 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP455198
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: 24929

218 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - N. CHARLESTON7235 CROSS COUNTRY RD.NORTH CHARLESTON, SCUS  29418Contact: MATT MITCHAMmatt.mitcham@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (843)414-1129
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Oiland filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.The iron level is abnormal.Moderate concentration of visiblemetal present. There is a moderateamount of visible silt present in thesample. Moderate concentration ofvisible dirt/debris present in the fluid.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal. The fluid is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO3387Unique No: 10940936Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Mar 2024
Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06126785 (Generated: 03/26/2024 20:24:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP455198 VCP304601 --- ---Sample Date 19 Mar 2024 10 Apr 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 12598 4561 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed N/A --- ---Sample Status SEVERE NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 34.6 28.0 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 67 0 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 1 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 189 1 --- ---Copper ppm 6 <1 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 1 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1022 99 --- ---Magnesium ppm 5 10 --- ---Zinc ppm 387 21 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 441 165 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 95 81 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06126785 (Generated: 03/26/2024 20:24:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3130\Transmission (Auto) [VCP455198] 19 Mar 2024 @ 12598.0 hrs

