
[[X18416]] VOLVO A40G 353135 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP445382
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: X18416

APAC BENTON393 OREILLY RDBENTON, MSUS  39039Contact: WILL RATLIFFwill.ratliffjr@apac.comT: (601)397-3696F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Tests indicate that thereis no fuel present in the oil. There isno indication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: APABENUnique No: 10941004Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 26 Mar 2024
Report Id: APABEN [WUSCAR] 06126853 (Generated: 03/26/2024 14:22:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILL RATLIFF - APABEN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP445382 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3526 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 83 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 66 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 61 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.5 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 24 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm 3 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 42 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1831 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 498 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1144 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1083 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 54 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: APABEN [WUSCAR] 06126853 (Generated: 03/26/2024 14:22:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WILL RATLIFF - APABEN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 353135\Diesel Engine [VCP445382] 20 Mar 2024 @ 3526.0 hrs

