
[[SPM686818]] SENNEBOGEN 835 835.0.2015 - RIGHT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP407402
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM686818

SIMS METAL MANAGEMENT2500 S. PAULINACHICAGO, ILUS  60608Contact: RYAN WISEryan.wise@simsmm.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SIMCHIILUnique No: 10941433Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 27 Mar 2024
Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 06127282 (Generated: 03/28/2024 02:42:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407402 VCP365832 VCP373874 VCP358516Sample Date 15 Mar 2024 26 Jan 2023 02 Aug 2022 07 Apr 2022Machine Hours 24766 23836 23382 22573Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 201 186 186 218
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG 0.198 NEG NEGSilicon ppm 25 18 11 11Sodium ppm 0 0 0 0Potassium ppm 2 7 5 15
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 128 388 171 453Copper ppm 50 228 184 146Lead ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 9 6 13Aluminum ppm 2 2 2 3Chromium ppm 1 3 2 3Molybdenum ppm 2 3 3 <1Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm <1 0 <1 0Manganese ppm 4 3 1 4Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2240 2939 2877 115Magnesium ppm 12 38 35 3Zinc ppm 1015 1025 1033 131Phosphorus ppm 849 918 896 458Barium ppm 16 <1 <1 0Boron ppm 10 30 24 26

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMCHIIL [WUSCAR] 06127282 (Generated: 03/28/2024 02:42:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN WISE - SIMCHIIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835 835.0.2015\Right Swing Drive [VCP407402] 15 Mar 2024 @ 24766.0 hrs

